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Even in the quest for luxurious surroundings and a life-changing holiday 
experience, there’s room for a bargain and Deal Hunter, offered through 
Expedia.com.au, helps Australian travelers to choose from the finest London 
hotels and other posh getaways at seriously discounted prices. Leveraging its 
database of over 100,000 hotels worldwide, Expedia.com.au picks the best 
offers, including exotic locales like Bangkok hotels, offering discounts as high 
as 50% off regular posted room rates. 

May, 2010 -- The web site discriminating Australian travelers have come to 
know and love continues to lead the way for those seeking a memorable 
vacation with a minimum of fuss in the highest quality surroundings. Through 
its Deal Hunter feature, Expedia.com.au offers thousands of luxurious hotel 
rooms in dozens of exotic locations at rates that are discounted by as much 
as 50% off the regular prices. For example, Bangkok hotels such as the 
Landmark Bangkok (rated 4.5 out of 5 stars by guests) are available through 
Deal Hunter at rates starting as low as $119. Discounts of 50% off rooms or 
suites in a hotel located in the heart of Bangkok’s entertainment district with 
an outdoor pool and sundeck, spa, health club and even traditional Thai 
cooking classes (held twice daily in the Nipa restaurant) are unheard of, but 
Expedia.co.au has built a reputation for making the luxurious and exotic 
affordable. 

In a recent feature on Rome, Money magazine called the Italian capital “a 
feast of a city.” Rome hotels can be expensive and with so many options 
available, it’s easy to pick the wrong one. Whether you’re looking for a 
modern, luxury experience or more unique villa-style accommodations, Deal 
Hunter on Expedia.com.au can ensure that your Rome adventure exceeds 
your expectations, while saving you money you can put towards authentic 
meals or perhaps an excursion to Pompeii or Florence (check the Activities 
feature to look for these and other excursion ideas). With hundreds of Rome 
area hotels available through Deal Hunter, you can even book a room in an 
ultra luxury location like the Aleph A Boscolo Luxury Hotel for as little as 



$470 per night. If that sounds expensive, remember that Rome hotels are 
among the finest in the world and this special rate through Expedia.com.au is 
at 45% off what the hotel normally charges. 

Expedia.com.au offers more than just discounted hotel rates. Other services 
include holiday packages, car rentals, travel insurance and flights that can be 
combined for further savings. Features such as Activities and Destinations 
make it easy to fully plan an adventure vacation, complete with listings of 
local activities and events that can be booked online. Of course there are 
hotel listings as well (with over 100,000 hotels in the database), and visitors 
can search by a wide range of criteria, including city, price and rating, 
making it much easier to choose which of the 882 London hotels on file is the 
right one. 

Operated by Expedia, Inc (the world’s largest online travel company), 
Expedia.com.au offers Australian travelers access to 110,000 hotels 
(including 272 Bangkok hotels ) and 180 airlines worldwide. Through its wide 
range of online features, including Activities, Destinations and Deal Hunter, 
Expedia.com.au gives Australians the ability to book exotic holidays at 
significantly discounted rates and even assemble packages including flights, 
car rentals, accommodations and tours for additional savings. Ratings by 
guests make it easy to avoid unpleasant surprises and Expedia.com.au 
makes it easy filter, so instead of sorting through 1552 Rome hotels, the list 
can be reduced to show only 5 Star rated facilities. 

For additional information about Expedia.com.au, please contact Jeremy 
Reitman using the following information: 

Contact Info: 
Jeremy Reitman 
Email Address: jreitman@expedia.com 
Telephone #: + 61 (0) 2 8090 6639 
Address: Suite 1, Level 2, 77 King St Sydney NSW 2000 Australia 

~~~~~  
 
Press release distributed via EPR Network (http://express-press-release.net/submit-press-
release.php) 
 


